Washburn City Commission 
[bookmark: _GoBack]Official Meeting Minutes
Monday, July 22, 2019
6:30 p.m., City Hall

Members Present: Larry Thomas, Noelle Kroll, Mike Herdt and Kit Baumann
Absent: Kollin Syverson
President Thomas called the Washburn City Board of Commissioners meeting to order at 6:30 p.m.
Baumann motioned to approve the July 8, 2019 meeting minutes.  Kroll seconded.  Upon roll call, all members present voted aye.  Motion carried.

Planning and Zoning recommend approving the 25-foot variance for Chad and Bridgett Tweeten for the front setback requirement on Lot 1 Block 1 Tweeten Addition.  Thomas motioned to approve the variance.  Baumann seconded.  Upon roll call, all members present voted aye.  Motion carried.

Elizabeth Patterson and Larry Thomas are requesting reappointment to the Planning and Zoning Commission.  Planning and Zoning Commission terms are 5 years. Kroll motioned to appoint Elizabeth Patterson and Larry Thomas to the Planning and Zoning Commission.  Herdt seconded.  Upon roll call, all members present voted aye.  Motion carried.

Milo Holznagel submitted a letter of interest to fill the open position on the Special Assessment Commission.  Baumann motioned to appoint Milo Holznagel to the Special Assessment Commission.  Herdt seconded.  Upon roll call, all members present voted aye.  Motion carried.

Thomas asked Jackie Dahl to open the bids for the public sale that ended 7/19/2019.  

The Forestry Board provided an Arbor Day proclamation.  Price read this proclamation.  Thomas motioned that June 15, 2019 was Arbor Day in the City of Washburn.  Kroll seconded.  Upon roll call, all members present voted aye.  Motion carried.  

Sumner Boschert was present requesting approval to allow him to create a bike bath with the Park Board providing help with maintenance and liability.  Kroll asked if he is still intending to mark the trail with signs.  Kroll motioned to approve the creation of this trail with a letter of support from the Park Board.  Herdt seconded.  Upon roll call, all members present voted aye.  Motion carried.

Price provided information regarding the Utility Billing late fee capabilities and Revtrak credit card transaction fees and Global payments credit card transaction fees, as these were items discussed during the last meeting.  After much discussion, Kroll motioned to continue to not pass the charge for the credit card transactions on to the credit card users.  Died for a lack of a second.  Herdt asked what the base utility bill is per month.  Price stated approximately $75.00.  Herdt said then the fee would be $2.62 on a $75.00 utility bill.  Price stated you have to remember this would also apply to those that pay traffic tickets, building permits by credit card.  Baumann motioned to pass the 3.49% Revtrak fee on to the users of this service.  Herdt seconded.  Upon roll call vote, Baumann – aye, Herdt – aye, Kroll-nay, Thomas-aye.  Motion carried.

Price will research the options for passing on the Global payment fees and report back at the next meeting.  Price asked what is the effective date to pass the Revtrak fees to on to the users.  Baumann August 1, 2019.

Price presented the State Fire and Tornado Fund Renewal for 7/1/2019 through 6/30/2020.  This policy is for commercial building and personal property.  Thomas motioned to renew this policy for $4,526.91.  Baumann seconded.  Upon roll call, all members present voted aye.  Motion carried.

Jackie Dahl read the following results of the highest bidder for the public sale items.
Item #1-HP Computer Monitor-Emmy Barnick
Item #2-Samsung Computer Monitor- Casey Neumiller
Item #3-HP Computer Monitor- Emmy Barnick
Item #4-withdrawn from sale
Item #5-Metal File Sorter – Tie -Emmy Barnick & Jason Dahl
Item #6-Metal File Sorter – No bid
Item #7-Plastic File Sorter – No bid
Item #8-Metal File Sorter – Jason Dahl
Item #9-Fellows Monitor Stand- Emmy Barnick
Item #10-Sharp Adding Machine-No bid
Item #11-Sharp Adding Machine-No bid
Item #12-Plastic Mail Tray-No bid
Item #13-Metal File Drawers-Jason Dahl
Item #14-Metal File Drawers-Jason Dahl
Item #15-White Board-Emmy Barnick
Item #16-Nighthawk Netgear Router-Tyler Klosterman
Item #17-HP Keyboard-Emmy Barnick
Item #18-HP Keyboard-No bid
Item #19-Microsoft Keyboard-No bid
Item #20-HP Keyboard-No bid
Item #21-Assorted Mice & Keyboard Gel Cushions-Casey Neumiller
Item #22-Linksys Switch-No bid
Item #23-Assorted Mice-No bid
Item #24-Withdrawn from Sale
Item #25-Brother Typewriter-No bid
Item #26-Camera & Tripod- Minimum bid not met
Item #27-Wood File Cabinet-No bid
Item #28-Metal File Cabinet-Emmy Barnick
Item #29-Metal File Cabinet-Emmy Barnick
Item #30-Lower Cabinets-Matthew Anderson
Item #31-Lower Cabinets-Matthew Anderson
Item #32-Pickup Topper-No bid
Item #33-1981 Dodge Truck-Tyler Dahme
Item #34-Floor Coverings & Tugger-No bid
Item #35-Upper Cabinets-Tyler Klostermann
Item #36-Old Sound System-Elray Sondrol

Thomas motioned to sell the items to the highest bidder.  Kroll seconded.  Upon roll call, all members present voted aye.  Motion carried.

Eric Lothspeich from AE2S gave an update on the following:
Main Avenue Street & Storm Sewer-The trees have been removed, with Weisz and Sons to be here to work on it later this week.  
Intake Project- Bid opening has been delayed until 8/15/2019.
Water Treatment Plant- no update
	
Portfolios:
Baumann- The Forestry Board met today to review removal of some trees.  Kulger Construction will be removing some trees and bringing them to the tree pile behind the City Hall.  The Forestry Board is looking in to adopt-a-plant-sight to help defray the cost of the maintenance of these plant sightings.  

Herdt- The A/C supports are repaired.  The hot water heater at the City Hall has been replaced.  Thank you to Larry Thomas and Kollin Syverson for helping with this replacement.  

Kroll-Nothing  

Thomas- They are still working on the Kitchen intake and exchange at the Memorial Hall.  

Price-Nothing 
Rothmann-Seals went out on pumps at the Water Treatment Plant, replacements have been ordered.

Price presented working papers for the 2020 Preliminary Budget.  The board reviewed and discussed.

Price presented an estimated proposal from Nexus for Special Assessment Financial Review.  Thomas motioned to accept the proposal for $20,600 with the work to be done this year.  Herdt seconded.  Upon roll call, all members present voted aye.  Motion carried.

Commissioner Baumann motioned to approve the bills.
	Check Number
	Vendor
	Date
	Amount

	1100   Farmers Sec.XX0074
	
	

	022390E
	INTERNAL REVENUE SERVICE
	7/16/2019
	$2,448.27

	022392E
	MDU
	7/23/2019
	$204.69

	022393E
	WEST RIVER TELEPHONE
	7/20/2019
	$623.07

	022395E
	BLUE CROSS BLUE SHIELD
	8/1/2019
	$4,674.30

	022396E
	MCLEAN ELECTRIC
	8/1/2019
	$163.50

	022397E
	CIRCLE SANITATION
	7/22/2019
	$7,965.00

	022398E
	OTTERTAIL POWER
	7/22/2019
	$5,117.33

	022399E
	INTERNAL REVENUE SERVICE
	7/2/2019
	$2,889.01

	30031-30037
	Payroll
	7/15/2019
	$8,144.07

	30038
	AE2S
	7/22/2019
	$960.50

	30039
	ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC.
	7/22/2019
	$459.00

	30040
	CARDMEMBER SERVICES
	7/22/2019
	$38.24

	30041
	ENERBASE COOPERATIVE
	7/22/2019
	$609.75

	30042
	ATT&T MOBILITY
	7/22/2019
	$96.70

	30043
	GREAT PLAINS REHABILITATION
	7/22/2019
	$140.00

	30044
	HAWKINS
	7/22/2019
	$16,586.54

	30045
	HELPER GUY
	7/22/2019
	$1,160.00

	30046
	INDUSTRIAL LUBRICANT COMPANY
	7/22/2019
	$1,432.45

	30047
	INNOVATIVE OFFICE SOLUTIONS LL
	7/22/2019
	$22.21

	30048
	J-S SANITATION
	7/22/2019
	$80.00

	30049
	LIBERTY BUSINESS SYSTEMS
	7/22/2019
	$234.19

	30050
	LINDELL LAW OFFICE
	7/22/2019
	$75.00

	30051
	MCLEAN COUNTY IMPLEMENT
	7/22/2019
	$1,099.13

	30052
	ND DEPT OF HEALTH LAB SERVICES
	7/22/2019
	$57.00

	30053
	ND DEPT OF INSURANCE
	7/22/2019
	$4,526.91

	30054
	ND HEALTH DEPT OF CHEMISTRY
	7/22/2019
	$16.48

	30055
	ND LEAGUE OF CITIES
	7/22/2019
	$1,316.00

	30056
	ND SEWAGE PUMP LIFT STATION SV
	7/22/2019
	$625.00

	30057
	ND WORKFORCE SAFETY
	7/22/2019
	$250.00

	30058
	ONE CALL CONCEPTS
	7/22/2019
	$15.60

	30059
	SALHUS SEPTIC PUMPING
	7/22/2019
	$180.00

	30060
	SCOTTS HARDWARE
	7/22/2019
	$815.23

	30061
	UNUM LIFE INSURANCE CO
	7/22/2019
	$126.99

	
	
	
	

	1115   Project Acct XX0787
	
	

	000017E
	CITY OF WASHBURN
	6/28/2019
	$74,164.57

	022394E
	CITY OF WASHBURN
	7/18/2019
	$23,780.00

	2024
	AE2S
	7/22/2019
	$53,195.50




Kroll seconded.  Upon roll call, all members present voted aye.  Motion carried.

The meeting was adjourned at 7:55 p.m.  


_____________________			_________________________
Ranie Price, Auditor				Larry Thomas, President
City of Washburn 				City of Washburn 


